
$3795.00 / Monthly - 200 LETT STREET UNIT#703
 

Listing ID: 1402996

$3795.00 / Monthly
2 Bedrooms, 2 BathroomsSingle Family

200 LETT STREET UNIT#703, Ottawa,
Ontario, K1R0A7

Seize the opportunity to experience the
pinnacle of luxury living. This open-concept
unit is bathed in natural light from wrap-
around floor-to-ceiling windows. The
bespoke high-end kitchen stands out with
elegant poured concrete countertops, a
versatile breakfast bar, and a custom glass
table that adjusts to your dining needs.
Banquet-style seating with under-bench
storage adds both style and practicality.
Both bedrooms are spacious, each equipped
with oversized built-in storage closets.
Delight in outdoor entertaining on your
expansive private terrace, perfect for
soaking in the scenery, with sweeping views
of the Ottawa River, the Gatineau Hills, and
Parliament. This unit includes an indoor
parking space and a storage locker for added
convenience. Centrally located, you’ll be
close to downtown, Little Italy, Chinatown,
and just steps from the Pimisi LRT station,
as well as accessible biking and nature
trails. This is a non-smoking building. Stove
is induction. (id:44244)
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